
2019 Glenn County 4-H Fashion Revue  
Traditional Scorecard - PRIMARY 

 

 
Name                
 

 
 

What the judges are 
looking for  

Comments:  

EXHIBITOR  

 
Self Esteem 
Poise/Posture 

 
 

Exhibits confidence. Self 
assured. Models garment to 
its best advantage. Good 
use of gestures and facial 
expressions. 

 

 
Personal 
presentation/ 
Grooming 

Fresh and well groomed. 
Neat in appearance. Skin, 
hair, nails clean and well 
cared for. Shoes spotless 
and in good condition.  

 

 
Verbal 
Communication 
 
Interaction with 
Judges 

 

Thorough knowledge of 
construction techniques, 
garment care, fabric and 
fiber content, cost. Engages 
confidently with judges. 
Makes full eye contact 

 

GARMENT(S)  

 
Choice of Style 

 
 
 

Outstanding harmony of 
style in relation to fabric, 
trim, construction and 
pleasing proportion to body 
type. Provides great 
flexibility in wardrobe. 
Learning skills challenged.  

 

 
Fit 

 
 
 

Combination of skills in 
making attractive, 
comfortable and becoming 
clothing, sized for style and 
body type. Appropriate ease 
to produce a great fit of 
neck, shoulder, sleeves, 
waist, crotch, side seams. 

 

 
Workmanship 
as it relates to 
outside appearance 

 
 

Construction will stand up to 
wear. Construction detail 
suited to style and fabric. 
Grain line maintained. Darts 
and seam lines correctly 
located. Clean and well 
pressed. 

 

 
Coordinated 
total look 

 

Outfit looks smart and put 
together. Fabric texture, 
trims, findings, color 
compliment the model. 
Accessories enhance 
overall look of outfit. 

 

Judge:  

 

 

Comments: 


